Road Materials /Public Works

BIDDER SIGNATURE PAGE
Rev. 9/20/05

1. If doing business under a trade name, partnership or a sole proprietorship, you must submit the bid under
exact title of the trade name, partnership, or proprietorship, and the bid must be signed by either the owner
or a partner and witnessed by a notary public.

2. Ifa Corporation, the bid must be signed by the President or Vice President and witnessed by Corporate
Secretary, (Corporate title must be exact) and affix corporate seal.

3. Other persons authorized by Corporate Resolution to execute agreements in its behalf may also sign the
bid documents (pages).

4. The Person who signs this bid form must also sign the Non-Collusion Affidavit.

5. You cannot witness your own signature.

Weldon Materials, Inc.

NAME OF BIDDER
Q00 s 144 Contral AVE
SIGNATURE @ A ADDRESS OF BIDDER

CORPORATE SECRETARY
Westfield, NJ 07090

Eileen Mooney, Asst. Secretary

PRINT NAME AND TITLE TELEPHONE: 908-233-4444
CORPORATE SECRETARY

FAX: 908-233-4215

EROTELLA@WELDONMAT.COM
pan)

v,

JSIGNATURE

November 8, 2024
DATE

AFFIX CORPORATE SEAL
Norbert W. Weldon, Vice President

PRINT OR TYPE NAME AND TITLE

WARNING: FAILURE TO FULLY, ACCURATELY, AND COMPLETELY SUPPLY THE INFORMATION
REQUESTED ON THIS PAGE MAY RESULT IN THE REJECTION OF YOUR BID AS NON-RESPONSIVE
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COOPERATIVE BID FORM PAGE 1 OF 4

SECTION III - COOPERATIVE MEMBERS - 1 TWELVE (12) MONTHS

[X ] CHECK HERE IF WILLING TO PROVIDE THE GOODS AND SERVICES HEREIN BID UPON TO REGISTERED
MEMBERS OF THE UNION COUNTY COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM, IDENTIFIER #8-UCCP WHO HAVE SUBMITTED
ESTIMATES, WITHOUT SUBSTITUTION OR DEVIATION FROM SPECIFICATIONS, SIZE, FEATURES, QUALITY, PRICE
OR AVAILABILITY AS HEREIN SET FORTH. IT IS UNDERSTOOD THAT ORDERS WILL BE PLACED DIRECTLY BY THE
REGISTERED MEMBERS IDENTIFIED HEREIN BY SEPARATE CONTRACT, SUBJECT TO THE OVERALL TERMS OF THE
MASTER CONTRACT TO BE AWARDED BY THE COUNTY OF UNION, AND THAT NO ADDITIONAL SERVICES OR
DELIVERY CHARGES WILL BE ALLOWED EXCEPT AS PERMITTED BY THESE SPECIFICATIONS.

[ ] CHECK HERE IF NOT WILLING TO EXTEND PRICES TO REGISTERED MEMBERS OF UNION COUNTY
COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM, IDENTIFIER #8-UCCP WHO HAVE SUBMITTED ESTIMATES AS DESCRIBED IN THE
SPECIFICATIONS. IT IS UNDERSTOOD THAT THIS WILL NOT ADVERSELY AFFECT CONSIDERATION OF THIS BID
WITH RESPECT TO THE NEEDS OF THE COUNTY OF UNION.

PLEASE BE AWARE THAT IN ACCORDANCE WITH N.J.LA.C. 5:34-1 ET SEQ. NO PRICE FOR A COOPERATIVE MEMBER
CAN BE DIFFERENT THAN THE ONE OFFERED TO THE COUNTY ON THE MASTER CONTRACT. THE LAW REQUIRES
THESE COOPERATIVE PRICES BE REPEATED ON THESE COOPERATIVE MEMBER PAGES.

IN THE EVENT THAT THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER DECLINES TO EXTEND PRICES TO THE REGISTERED
MEMBERS WHO SUBMITTED ESTIMATES THE FOLLOWING PROCEDURE WILL BE FOLLOWED AS REQUIRED BY
N.J.A.C. 5:34-7.10(A): THE CONTRACT FOR THE NEEDS OF THE LEAD AGENCY WILL BE AWARDED TO THE LOWEST
RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, AND A MASTER CONTRACT FOR THE REGISTERED MEMBERS WHO HAVE SUBMITTED
ESTIMATES WILL BE AWARDED TO THE NEXT LOWEST BIDDER WHOSE BID AGREES TO EXTEND.

[nitial
LOT #1
QUANTITY SURCHARGE
ITEM # (MORE OR LESS) UNIT PRICE SUB TOTAL FOR DELIVERY
1 2755 Tons X ¢ 7105 _ g 19574275 g FOBONLY
(PER TON) (PER TON)
2 6425 Tons X ¢ T408 — ¢ 47577125 ¢ FOBONLY
(PER TON) (PER TON)
3 60 Tandem Loads X $ G0v.90 =$ $0,000.00 $ NA
(PER TANDEM LOAD) (PER LOAD)
4 2020 Tons X  $ NOBID = j_NOBE - R
(PER TON) (PER TON)
86.05 40,443.50
5 470  Tons X $ =$ ¢ FOBONLY

(PER TON)

NAME OF BIDDER: Weldon Materials, Inc.

(PER TON)

23

PRICES BASED ON ESCALATION BASED ON NJDOT INDEX FROM OCTOBER 2024 1ST HALF @$538.00
*STONE DELIVERY RATE IS BASED ON A 22 TON MINIMUM

**CONCRETE: PLUS ADDITIVE COSTS AS PER REQUESTED AT TIME OF ORDER AND DELIVERED ONLY IN UNION COUNTY



COOPERATIVE BID FORM PAGE 2 OF 4

SECTION III - COOPERATIVE MEMBERS - 1** TWELVE (12) MONTHS

LOT #1 - continued

QUANTITY SURCHARGE
ITEM # (MORE OR LESS) UNIT PRICE SUB TOTAL FOR DELIVERY
(PER TON) (PER TON)
7 115 Tons X  § 2408 = g 966575 ¢ FOBONLY
(PER TON) (PER TON)
FOB WATCHUNG ONLY
(PER TON) (PER TON)
1.80 630.00
9 350 Sq.Ft. X $ _ g g FOBWATCHUNG ONLY
(PER SQ. FT) (PER SQ. FT)
10 2637 Tons X  § 2175 = § 73.176.75 g 8007
(PER TON) (PER TON)
i o g 2200 _ ¢ 23,870.00 g 8.00°
(PER TON) (PER TON)
12 510 Tons X g 60.00 _ ¢ 30,600.00 g 800
(PER TON) (PER TON)
13 1120 Tons X  § 26.00 = g OV g 9%
(PER TON) (PER TON)
14 3555 Tons X  §_27-00 = § 9598500 5_°0
(PER TON) (PER TON)
15 1165 Tons X  §_ 900 = § 10485200 g B8.00°
(PER TON) (PER TON)
16 220 Tons X  § 4200 = SA000 $ _8.00°
(PER TON) (PER TON)
17 543 Tons X $ 42.00 =$ 22,806.00 $ 8.00*
(PER TON) (PER TON)
18 729 Bags X § 1675 _ g 1221075 g FOB WATCHUNG ONLY
(PER BAG) (PER BAG)

(PER CUBIC YARD) (PER LOAD/MAX 10 CU YD)

NAME OF BIDDER: Weldon Materials, Inc.

24
PRICES BASED ON ESCALATION BASED ON NJDOT INDEX FROM OCTOBER 2024 1ST HALF @$538.00
*STONE DELIVERY RATE IS BASED ON A 22 TON MINIMUM
*CONCRETE: PLUS ADDITIVE COSTS AS PER REQUESTED AT TIME OF ORDER AND DELIVERED ONLY IN UNION COUNTY



SECTION III - COOPERATIVE MEMBERS - ¥ TWELVE (12) MONTHS

COOPERATIVE BID FORM PAGE 3 OF 4

LOT #1 - continued

QUANTITY SURCHARGE
ITEM # (MORE OR LESS) UNIT PRICE SUB TOTAL FOR DELIVERY
20 775  Lbs X NO BID = ¢ NOBID $ NOBID
(PER LB) (PER LB)
21 800 Tons X 24.00 = ¢ 19,200.00 g 0@
(PER TON) (PER TON)
2 375 Each X 140.00 = $ 52,500.00 § FOB WATCHUNG ONLY
(PER BLOCK) (PER BLOCK)
23 50 Gallons X 28.00 = ¢ 1/400.00 ¢ FOB WATCHUNG ONLY
(PER GALLON) (PER GALLON)
24 825 Bags X 10.10 = ¢ 8,332.50 ¢ FOB WATCHUNG ONLY
(PER BAG) (PER BAG)
25 220 Tons X 15.50 = g %9700 5 8:00°
(PER TON) (PER TON)
26 625 Cu. Yds. X 145.00 ~ ¢ 90,625.00 g 365.00"
(PER CUBIC YARD) (PER LOAD/MAX 10 CU YD)
142.00 365.00**
27 625 Cu.Yds. X = ¢ 88,750.00 $
(PER CUBIC YARD) (PER LOAD/MAX 10 CU YD)
28 620 Tandem Loads X $ 500.00 =% 310,000.00 $ N/A
(PER TANDEM LOAD) (PER LOAD)
ASPHALT PRICE ADJUSTMENT PER TON $ 538.00

OCTOBER 2024 1$T HAYF @$538.00

GRAND TOTAL LOT #1 § 2.022,165.25
(NOT TO EXCEED)
LOT #2
QUANTITY GRAND TOTAL SURCHARGE
ITEM # (MORE OR LESS) UNIT PRICE LOT #2 FOR DELIVERY
1 433 Pails X $ 90.00 = $ 38,970.00 $ FOB WATCHUNG ONLY
(PER PAIL) (NOT TO EXCEED) (PER PAIL)

NAME OF BIDDER: Weldon Materials, Inc.

25
PRICES BASED ON ESCALATION BASED ON NJDOT INDEX FROM OCTOBER 2024 1ST HALF @$538.00
*STONE DELIVERY RATE IS BASED ON A 22 TON MINIMUM
**CONCRETE: PLUS ADDITIVE COSTS AS PER REQUESTED AT TIME OF ORDER AND DELIVERED ONLY IN UNION COUNTY



COOPERATIVE BID FORM PAGE 4 OF 4

SECTION III - COOPERATIVE MEMBERS - 1 TWELVE (12) MONTHS

LOT #3
QUANTITY GRAND TOTAL SURCHARGE
ITEM # (MORE OR LESS) UNIT PRICE LOT #3 FOR DELIVERY
1 50 Gallons X $ NO BID =$ NO BID $ NO BID
(PER GALLON) (NOT TO EXCEED) (PER GALLON)
LOT #4
QUANTITY GRAND TOTAL SURCHARGE
ITEM # (MORE OR LESS) UNIT PRICE LOT #4 FOR DELIVERY
1 492  Bags X ¢ 18.50 - ¢ 9,102.00 ¢ FOB WATCHUNG ONLY
(PER BAG) (NOT TO EXCEED) (PER BAG)

NAME OF BIDDER: Weldon Materials, Inc.

26
PRICES BASED ON ESCALATION BASED ON NJDOT INDEX FROM OCTOBER 2024 1ST HALF @$538.00

*STONE DELIVERY RATE IS BASED ON A 22 TON MINIMUM
**CONCRETE: PLUS ADDITIVE COSTS AS PER REQUESTED AT TIME OF ORDER AND DELIVERED ONLY IN UNION COUNTY



NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
Rev. 1/22/93

STATE OF New Jersey

SS:
COUNTY OF _Union
| Norbert W. Weldon of the City of __ Summit , in the County
of _Union and the State of New Jersey , of full age, being duly sworn
according to law, on my oath depose and say that: I am Vice President of the firm of
Weldon Materials, Inc. , the bidder making the Proposal for the above named project, and

that I executed the said Proposal with full authority to do so; that said bidder has not, directly or indirectly, entered
into any agreement, participation in any collusion, or otherwise taken any action in restraint of free, competitive
bidding in connection with the above named project; and that all statements contained in said Proposal and in this
Affidavit are true and correct, and made with full knowledge that the COUNTY OF UNION, NEW JERSEY
relies upon the truth of the statements contained in said Proposal and in the statements contained in the affidavit
in awarding the contract for the said project.

[ further warrant that no person or selling agency has been employed or retained to solicit or secure such contract
upon an agreement or understanding for a commission, percentage, brokerage or contingent fee, except bona fide
employees or bona fide established commercial or selling agencies maintained by
Weldon Materials, Inc.

NAME OF CONTRACTOR

Subscribed and sworn to before (Original signature only; stamped

Me this % day of NO\I , 2023 . signature not accepted)

ma?y_up—ublic éfthe State of A/ £

NOTE TO NOTARY: WHEN COMPLETING THIS JURAT, ALL NOTARIES MUST:
1. Indicate date. 2. Indicate State. 3. Sign name. 4. Affix name by
Printing it, typing it, using a rubber stamp, using an impression seal
or using a mechanical stamp.

Note: The person who signed the bid form for the bidder should sign this form also.

WARNING: IF YOU FAIL TO FULLY, ACCURATELY AND COMPLETELY FILL OUT THIS AFFIDAVIT
OF NON-COLLUSION, YOU BID WILL BE REJECTED.

36



AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REQUIREMENT
Rev. 6/29/93

REQUIRED AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EVIDENCE
General Requirements of P.L. 1975, ¢. 127: You are hereby put on notice that:
A. Procurement, Professional & Service Contracts

All successful vendors must submit within seven days of the notice of intent to award or the signing of the
contract one of the following: PLEASE CHECK ONE

D A photocopy of your Federal Letter of Affirmative Action Plan Approval
OR

A photocopy of your Certificate of Employee Information Report
OR

[I A completed Affirmative Action Employee Information Report (AA302)

If successful vendor does not submit the affirmative action document within the seven days the County of
Union will declare the vendor as being non-responsive and award the contract to the next lowest bidder.

Weldon Materials, Inc.
ot on ty NAME here

(W
v Y Sign NAME and TITLE here
(Original signature only, stamped signature not accepted)

Norbert W. Weldon, Vice President
Print or type NAME and TITLE here

November 8, 2024
Print or type DATE
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Certification 6686
CERTIFICATE OF EMPLOYEE INFORMAT!ON REPORT
RENEWAL

This is to certify that the contractor listed- below has submztted an Employee Information Report pursuant to
N.JA.C. 17:27-1.1 et. seq. and the State Treasurer has approved sald report. This approval will remain in

effect for the period of ~ 15-~MAR~ 2022 ' tol5 - MAR 2025
5 1 g i bt :f‘j!ii,,
1L 3 # > bt § 3 Téz d
% e . 1o “ ‘é;:.', §' 4
WELDON MATERIALS, INC./ WELDON CONCRETE/ WELDON
141 CENTRAL AVENUE 3 7
WESTFIELD NJ 070 90 I T :

ELIZABETH MAHER MUOIO
State Treasurer



AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY FOR INDIVIDUALS WITH DISABILITIES

The contractor and the County of Union (hereafter “Owner”) do hereby agree that the provisions of Title II of the Americans With
Disabilities Act of 1990 (the “Act”) (42 U.S.C. S12.101 et seq.), which prohibits discrimination on the basis of disability by public
entities in all services, programs and activities provided or made available by public entities, and the rules and regulations promulgated
pursuant thereunto, are made a part of this contract. In providing any aid, benefit, or service on behalf of the Owner pursuant to this
contract, the contractor agrees that the performance shall be in strict compliance with the Act. In the event the contractor, its agents,
servants, employees, or subcontractors violate or are alleged to have violated the Act during the performance of this contract, the
contractor shall defend the Owner in any action or administrative proceeding commenced pursuant to this Act. The contractor shall
indemnify, protect, and save harmless the Owner, its agents, servants, and employees from and against any and all suits, claims, losses,
demands, or damages of whatever kind or nature arising out of or claimed to arise out of the alleged violation. The contractor shall, at
its own expense, appear, defend, any pay any and all charges for legal services and any and all costs and other expenses arising from
such action or administrative proceeding or incurred in connection therewith. In any and all complaints brought pursuant to the Owner’s
grievance procedure, the contractor agrees to abide by any decision of the Owner which is rendered pursuant to said grievance procedure.
If any action or administrative proceeding results in an award of damages against the Owner, or if the Owner incurs any expense to cure
a violation of the ADA which has been brought pursuant to its grievance procedure, the contractor shall satisfy and discharge the same
at its own expense.

The Owner shall, as soon as practicable after a claim has been made against it, give written notice thereof to the contractor along with
full and complete particulars of the claim. If any action or administrative proceeding is brought against the Owner or any of its agents,
servants, and employees, the Owner shall expeditiously forward or have forwarded to the contractor every demand, complaint, notice,
summons, pleading, or other process received by the Owner or its representatives.

It is expressly agreed and understood that any approval by the Owner of the services provided by the contractor pursuant to this contract
will not relieve the contractor of the obligation to comply with the Act and to defend, indemnify, protect, and save harmless the Owner
pursuant to this paragraph.

It is further agreed and understood that the Owner assumes no obligation to indemnify or save harmless the contractor, its agents,
servants, employees and subcontractors for any claim which may arise out of their performance of this Agreement. Furthermore, the
contractor expressly understands and agrees that the provisions of this indemnification clause shall in no way limit the contractor’s
obligations assumed in this Agreement, nor shall they be construed to relieve the contractor from any liability, nor preclude the Owner
from taking any other actions available to it under any other provisions of this Agreement or otherwise at law.

Name Norbert W. Weldon N A (Please print or type)

T
e
ignature y yi73

Date November 8, 2024

NAME OF BIDDER: Weldon Materials, Inc.
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COUNTY OF UNION NEW JERSEY
Division of Purchasing
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN FORM

Solicitation Number: UCCP #64-2024 Vendor/Bidder: Weldon Materials, Inc.

PART 1
CERTIFICATION
VENDOR/BIDDER MUST COMPLETE PART 1 BY CHECKING ONE OF THE BOXES
FAILURE TO CHECK ONE OF THE BOXES WILL RENDER THE PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE

Pursuant to Public Law 2012, c. 25, any person or entity that submits a bid or proposal or otherwise proposes to enter into or renew a contract must
complete the certification below to attest, under penalty of perjury, that neither the person nor entity, nor any of its parents, subsidiaries, or affiliates,
is identified on the State of New Jersey, Department of the Treasury’s Chapter 25 list as a person or entity engaged in investment activities in Iran. The
Chapter 25 list is found on the Department’s website at http://www.state.nj.us/treasurv/pdf/Chapter25List.pdf. Vendors/Bidders must review this list
prior to completing the below certification. Failure to complete the certification will render a Vendor’s/Bidder’s proposal non-responsive. If the
Director of the Division of Purchase and Property finds a person or entity to be in violation of the law, s/he shall take action as may be appropriate and
provided by law, rule or contract, including but not limited to, imposing sanctions, seeking compliance, recovering damages, declaring the party in
default and seeking debarment or suspension of the party.
CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX

X] A. I certify, pursuant to Public Law 2012, ¢.25, that neither the Vendor/Bidder listed above nor any of its parents, subsidiaries,
or affiliates is listed on the N.J. Department of Treasury’s list of entities determined to be engaged in prohibited activities in Iran
pursuant to P.L. 2012, c. 25 (“Chapter 25 List”). Disregard Part 2 and complete and sign the Certification below.

OR

D B. I am unable to certify as above because the Vendor/Bidder and/or one or more of its parents, subsidiaries, or affiliates is

listed on the Department’s Chapter 25 list. I will provide a detailed, accurate and precise description of the activities in Part 2 below
and sign and complete the Certification below. Failure to provide such information will result in the proposal being rendered as
non-responsive and appropriate penalties, fines and/or sanctions will be assessed as provided by law.

PART 2
PLEASE PROVIDE ADDITIONAL INFORMATION RELATED TO INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN
If you checked Box “B” above, provide a detailed, accurate and precise description of the activities of the Vendor/Bidder, or one of its
parents, subsidiaries or affiliates, engaged in investment activities in [ran by completing the information below.

ENTITY NAME:

RELATIONSHIP TO VENDOR/BIDDER:
DESCRIPTION OF ACTIVITIES:
DURATION OF ENGAGEMENT:
ANTICIPATED CESSATION DATE:
VENDOR/BIDDER CONTACT NAME:
VENDOR/BIDDER CONTACT PHONE#:
Attach Additional Sheets If Necessary

CERTIFICATION
I, the undersigned, certify that I am authorized to execute this certification on behalf of the Vendor/Bidder, that the foregoing information and any
attachments hereto, to the best of my knowledge are true and complete. I acknowledge that the County of Union, New Jersey is relying on the
information contained herein, and that the Vendor/Bidder is under a continuing obligation from the date of this certification through the completion of
any contract(s) with the County of Union to notify the County of Union in writing of any changes to the information contained herein; that [ am aware
that it is a crimingl offense (g Myake a false statement ormisrepresentation in this certification. If I do so, I will be subject to criminal prosecution under

the law, and it yifl i eement(s) with the County of Union, permitting the County of Union to declare any contract(s)
resulting thig cefti
/ November 8, 2024

Signatuf /"’: 4 h Date

Norbert W. Weldon, Vice President
Print Name and Title
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CERTIFICATION OF NON-INVOLVEMENT IN
PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES IN RUSSIA OR BELARUS

Pursuant to N.J.S.A. 52:32-60.1, et seq. (L. 2022. ¢c. 3) any person or entity (hereinafter “Vendor") that seeks to enter
into or renew a contract with a State agency for the provision of goods or services, or the purchase of bonds or other
obligations, must complete the certification below indicating whether or not the Vendor is identified on the Office of
Foreign Assets Control (OFAC) Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list, available here:
https://sanctionssearch.ofac.treas.gov/. If the Department of the Treasury finds that a Vendor has made a certification
in violation of the law, it shall take any action as may be appropriate and provided by law, rule or contract, including but
not limited to, imposing sanctions, seeking compliance, recovering damages, declaring the party in default and seeking
debarment or suspension of the party.

I, the undersigned, certify that | have read the definition of “Vendor” below, and have reviewed the Office of Foreign
Assets Control (OFAC) Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list, and having done so certify:

(Check the Appropriate Box)

That the Vendor is not identified on the OFAC Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list on
® account of activity related to Russia and/or Belarus.

OR

@ B That | am unable to certify as to “A” above, because the Vendor is identified on the OFAC Specially
" Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list on account of activity related to Russia and/or Belarus.

OR

That | am unable to certify as to “A” above, because the Vendor is identified on the OFAC Specially
@ c Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list. However, the Vendor is engaged in activity related to Russia
" and/or Belarus consistent with federal law, regulation, license or exemption. A detailed description of how

the Vendor’s activity related to Russia and/or Belarus is consistent with federal law is set forth below.

m
/ (Attach Additional Sheets If Necessary.)
November 8, 2024

Signature &f Vendor's Authorized Representative Date
Norbert W. Weldon, Vice President 22-2801289
Print Name and Title of Vendor's Authorized Representative Vendor's FEIN

Weldon Materials, Inc. 908-233-4444

Vendor's Name Vendor's Phone Number

141 Central Ave 908-233-4215

Vendor's Address (Street Address) Vendor's Fax Number
Westfield, NJ 07090 erotella@weldonmat.com
Vendor's Address (City/State/Zip Code) Vendor’'s Email Address

' Vendor means: (1) A natural person, corporation, company, limited partnership, limited liability partnership, limited liability company,
business association, sole proprietorship, joint venture, partnership, society, trust, or any other nongovernmental entity, organization,
or group; (2) Any governmental entity or instrumentality of a government, including a multilateral development institution, as defined in
Section 1701(c)(3) of the International Financial Institutions Act, 22 U.S.C. 262r(c)(3); or (3) Any parent, successor, subunit, direct or
indirect subsidiary, or any entity under common ownership or control with, any entity described in paragraph (1) or (2).
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07/14/04
Taxpayer |dentification# 222-801-289/002

Dear Business Representative:
Congratulations! You are now registered with the New Jersey Division of Revenue.

Use the Taxpayer |dentification Number listed above on all correspondence with the Divisions
of Revenue and Taxation, as well as with the Department of Labor (if the business is subject
to unemployment withholdings). Your tax returns and payments will be filed under this number,
and you will be able to access information about your account by referencing it.

Additionally, please note that State law (Public Law 2001, c.134) requires all contractors and
subcontractors with State agencies to provide proof of their registration with the Division

of Revenue. The law also amended Section 92 of the Casino Control Act, which deals with the
casino service industry.

We have attached a Proof of Registration Certificate for your use. To comply with the law, if you are
currently under contract or entering into a contract with a State agency, you must provide a copy
of the certificate to the contracting agency.

If you have any questions or require more information, feel free to call our Registration Hotline at (609)
292-1730.

| wish you continued success in your business endeavors.

Sincerely, /

John E. Tu{lfy, CPA
Acting Director

' [:_,.&v.!.!,!.'_',!._!_,!,"'_g!qf_o.'ﬁ?p!h!\‘*’h!’! o7 (R "'_'!-'A'-!%'-.'s'.!'!Y~'a'~!'ﬁ't‘\'*"'»""*-‘-1 6\?‘.}&%‘\5&?@%&&5@-&&&

: STATE OF NEW JERSEY 7
BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

FOR STATE AGENCY AND CASINO SERVICE CONTRACTORS

)
.

DEPARTMENT OF TREASURY/ '
DIVISION OF REVENUE

RNTTSRIR

P
4 TRENTON, N J 08646-0252

[-r-v'.a'a Ia¥sTaVa¥e Ve

S R T R R R R R R R R R R R R R R R R R R Ry AYAYAYAYANAYAYAY =

TAXPAYER NAME: _ TRADE NAME: |
fl  WELDON MATERIALS, INC. * WELDON CONCRETE CO
| TAXPAYER IDENTIFICATION#: -~ 'SEQUENCE NUMBER:

ol 222801280002 - "4or0074
B ADDRESs: o | ISSUANCE DATE:
EHl 141 CENTRAL AVE F——

WESTFIELD NJ 07090,
EFFECTIVE DATE:
10/01/91 ‘
Acli

FO RM-BRC(08-01) This Certificate 1s NOT assignable or transferabl
R R T e B R R T

ORISIAI IS SIS

( (el

Director
It must be conspicuouslyl displayed at above address




MAP

Attach copy of Google Map or MapQuest from address of asphalt plant to nearest Union County border as
described on Page 14.

NAME OF BIDDER: Weldon Materials, Inc.
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https://weldonmat.com/our-locations.html

Weldon Materials - Our Locations ‘
. w . . . nttps:/weldonmat.com)
weldon'materials, inc.

OUR LOCATIONS

Weldon Materials operates 7 locations in the Northern New Jersey area

Plants and Quarries are strategically placed to offer ease of access and proximity to truck
transportation routes.

The map below provides information about all our locations as well as driving interactive driving
directions.

You Can Also Download "truck friendly" directions here (/our-locations.html?id=111:truck-friendly-

directions&catid=43:general-info)
% uicet directions-.
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COUNTY OF UNION
BID SUBMISSION CHECKLIST

ROAD MATERIALS
UCCP # 64-2024

Each bidder should complete this form. initial each entry. sign and date at the bottom and submit with bid.

[ ) ‘\_JS 1. Bid Form Page(s)

DV i 2 Bidder Signature Page — follow instructions and fill out completely
{Z M 3. Statement of Ownership Disclosure (2 pages)
i Z ' | 4. Non-Collusion Affidavit — fill out completely and notarize

‘ M s Affirmative Action Requirement

) 6. Americans with Disabilities Form
™ 7. Disclosure of Investment Activities in Iran Form
| M 8. Certification of Non-Involvement in Prohibited Activities in Russia or Belarus

M 9. Copy of a State of New Jersey Business Registration Certificate (“BRC”) issued in the company
name of the bidder and in the names of any subcontractors, if applicable

‘ 2\)\ 10.  Extension Form for Union County Cooperative Pricing System

M 11, Distance Map

12.  Addenda Receipt Form — ONLY INCLUDE IF ADDENDA(S) WERE RECEIVED

Weldon Materials, Inc. 11/8/2024

NAME OF BIDDER: DATE:




